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QUESTION 1

A BPM application developer needs to create an integration with FileNet V5.1 to retrieve images for the approval of car
repairs for an insurance company. 

What does the BPM application 

developer need to do to create this integration? Within an integration service: 

A. 1. drag a Content Integration component onto the canvas. 

2.

 select an Enterprise Content Management server. 

3.

 select the appropriate operation. 

B. 1. drag a Java Integration component onto the canvas. 

2.

 select an Enterprise Content Management Java class. 

3.

 select the appropriate method. 

C. 1. select the Content Integration task in the activity Wizard. 

2.

 drag a ECM Integration Service component onto the canvas. 

3.

 select an Enterprise Content Management server. 

4.

 select the appropriate operation. 

D. 1. select the Content Integration task in the activity Wizard. 

2.

 drag a Nested Service component onto the canvas. 

3.

 select the ECM Integration Service as the implementation for the Nested Service. 

4.
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 create the appropriate variables. 

Correct Answer: A 

 

 

QUESTION 2

A BPM application developer is creating a General System Service that calls an Integration Service. The General
System Service must handle exceptions coming from the integration service. 

How should the BPM application developer implement error handling? 

A. Error End Event 

B. Error Intermediate Event 

C. Throw Statement(s) 

D. Try/Catch Statement(s) 

Correct Answer: B 

 

 

QUESTION 3

A BPM application developer has been asked to provide guidance with the creation of a single coach for a financial
company. This coach must: ?allow a business user to specify a stock symbol only once. ?provide the current value of
the specified stock symbol. ?provide the current day\\'s trending data of the specified stock symbol. ?provide the current
week\\'s trending data of the specified stock symbol. 

What guidance should the BPM application developer provide? 

A. Within a human service, create a coach that prompts for a stock symbol and then pass the specified stock symbol to
another coach that will display the stock\\'s information. 

B. Within a human service, create a coach that includes a coach view for each of the company\\'s requirements and use
the stock symbol\\'s coach view to build the user experience based on its configured boundary event. 

C. Within a coach, use a custom coach view that is comprised of a number of different stock coach views and use
JavaScript within the custom coach view\\'s event handlers to build the user experience based on a specified stock
symbol. 

D. Create a coach based on a template that uses a number of different stock coach views and use JavaScript within a
Custom HTML component to build the user experience based on a specified stock symbol. 

Correct Answer: B 
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QUESTION 4

Which statement correctly describes a type of service available in Business Process Manager V8.0? 

A. An Ajax service can be used to generate tasks in the IBM Process Portal user interface. 

B. An Integration service is the only type of service that can contain a Java or Web Service integration component. 

C. In addition to implementing business rules, Decision services are used for manipulating variable data. 

D. General System services are used to build custom functionality into the BPD for any non-supported service types. 

Correct Answer: B 

 

 

QUESTION 5

A client executive has asked a BPM application developer to provide the focus areas for four playbacks. How should the
BPM application developer respond? 

A. Playback 0: BlueworksLive model Playback 1: Process diagram in Process Designer Playback 2: User interfaces and
integrations Playback 3: Error Handling 

B. Playback 0: BlueworksLive model Playback 1: Process discovery Playback 2: Human services and data mapping
Playback 3: Integrations and consolidation of previous themes 

C. Playback 0: Process flow implementation Playback 1: Business rules Playback 2: Human services and data mapping
Playback 3: Integrations, corner cases and error handling 

D. Playback 0: Process discovery and high level business process. Playback 1: Data model, process flow and human
services Playback 2: Business rules and integrations Playback 3: Consolidation of previous themes 

Correct Answer: D  

 

QUESTION 6

A BPM application developer needs to create custom SQL queries targeting the Business Performance Data
Warehouse to satisfy a customer\\'s reporting requirements. While browsing the system catalog of the database
management system, the developer notices tables and views corresponding to the tracking groups defined in the
process application. 

Which database artifacts should the developer query to obtain only the actively tracked data? The BPM application
developer should query the: 

A. views, because the views contains more recent data than the tables. 

B. views, because the views contain only the data resulting from the updated tracking definitions. 

C. tables, because the tables contains more recent data than the views. 

D. tables, because the tables contain only the data resulting from the updated tracking definitions. 
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Correct Answer: B 

 

 

QUESTION 7

A BPM application developer is developing a BPM solution in a process application called \\'Auto Loan Review
Process\\' (ALREV). ALREV has an existing dependency on a toolkit called \\'Financial Calculation Services\\'
(FCSERV). The developer is asked to update an integration service in FCSERV and use that new service in ALREV. 

What steps must the developer take to ensure that ALREV will utilize the new service created in FCSERV? 

A. 1. Update the integration service in FCSERV 

2.

 Take a snapshot of FCSERV 

3.

 Update the dependency of ALREV from the FCSERV toolkit 

B. 1. Update the integration service in FCSERV 

2.

 Take a snapshot of FCSERV 

3.

 Update dependency on FCSERV from the ALREV process application 

C. 1. Create a new integration service in ALREV 

2.

 Move the new integration service from ALREV to FCSERV 

3.

 Take a snapshot of FCSERV 

D. 1. Take a snapshot of FCSERV 

2.

 Update the integration service in FCSERV 

3.

 Update dependency on FCSERV in the ALREV process application 

Correct Answer: B 
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QUESTION 8

A sales company wants to be able to report on the total amount of sales per region. 

How can a BPM application developer capture this information so that the data can be reported on? (Choose two) The
BPM application developer needs to use: 

A. Autotracking 

B. Shared Business Object 

C. Exposed Process Value (EPV) 

D. Service Level Agreement (SLA) 

E. Custom Key Performance Indicator (KPI) 

Correct Answer: AE 

 

 

QUESTION 9

A BPM application developer needs to create a business process that will contain several human services. After
development begins, the developer learns that some of the task participants could be defined by the internal IBM BPM
security provider, while others could be defined in an external LDAP server. 

How should the developer proceed in order to allow this mix of users to participate in the process? 

The BPM application developer should: 

A. use only the external LDAP provider and recreate the internal users in the external LDAP server. 

B. use only the internal IBM BPM security provider and recreate the external LDAP users so that they are defined by the
internal IBM BPM security provider. 

C. use either the internal IBM BPM security provider or the external LDAP provider, but not both. All users must exist in
either the internal IBM BPM security provider or the external LDAP server. 

D. use the internal IBM BPM security provider in conjunction with the external LDAP provider. Create an IBM BPM
security group and add the external LDAP users using the Process Admin Console. 

Correct Answer: D 

 

 

QUESTION 10

A BPM application developer has completed the development of a process application. The team lead has now directed
the application developer to install the snapshot onto a staging server for additional testing before it is moved into
production. Assuming the default Process Server settings are in place, what minimum level of access must the
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developer have in order to install the snapshot onto the staging server? The application developer must have, at a
minimum: 

A. write access to the process application with no additional group membership. 

B. write access to the process application and must be a member of the process-center-install-group as defined in the
100Custom.xml file. 

C. administrative access to the process application with no additional group membership. 

D. administrative access to the process application and must be a member of the process-center-install-group as
defined in the 100Custom.xml file. 

Correct Answer: A 

 

 

QUESTION 11

A company\\'s sales process relies on business rules that have been implemented within WebSphere Operational
Decision Management (WODM). There is a requirement to incorporate these rules within a IBM Business Process
Manager V8.0 implementation. What steps must a BPM application developer take to incorporate these rules within IBM
Business Process Manager V8.0 assuming the WODM server has been properly configured within IBM Business
Process Manager V8.0. Within a decision service: 

A. 1. drag a BAL Rule from the palette onto the canvas. 

2.

 select a server . 

3.

 configure the SOAP port. 

4.

 provide credentials. 

B. 1. drag a Server Script from the palette onto the canvas. 

2.

 use JavaScript APIs to get ODM server information. 

3.

 use JavaScript APIs to make ODM server calls. 

C. 1. drag a Decision Table from the palette onto the canvas. 

2.

 select a server. 
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3.

 specify conditions and actions. 

D. 1. drag a JRules Decision Service from the palette onto the canvas. 

2.

 select a server. 

3.

 configure the SOAP port. 

4.

 provide credentials. 

Correct Answer: D 

 

 

QUESTION 12

A company requires all requests to be viewed by a member of the Executive Leadership and a member of its Legal
Department. These reviews must be executed independently of each other. Once these reviews are completed, an
email is sent out to all relevant process stakeholders informing them of the outcome of the reviews. Review the following
business process definition. 
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How should a BPM application developer model the remainder of the subprocess, "Conduct Request Reviews?" 

A. Draw two sequence flow lines from Reviews Start to Conduct Executive Review and Conduct Legal Review. From
each review activity, draw a sequence flow to Reviews End. 

B. Draw a sequence flow line from Reviews Start to Conduct Executive Review. From Conduct Executive Review, draw
a sequence flow line to Conduct Legal Review. From Conduct Legal Review, draw a sequence flow line to Reviews
End. 

C. Draw a sequence flow line from Reviews Start to a Parallel Gateway. From the Parallel Gateway, draw two sequence
flow lines to Conduct Executive Review and to Conduct Legal Review. From each review activity, draw a sequence flow
line to Reviews End. 

D. Draw a sequence flow line from Reviews Start to an Exclusive Gateway. From the Exclusive Gateway, draw two
sequence flow lines to Conduct Executive Review and to Conduct Legal Review. From each review activity, draw a
sequence flow to Reviews End. 

Correct Answer: C 
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