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QUESTION 1

At home, you use a Windows 10 desktop computer. At work, you use a Windows 10 laptop that is connected to a
corporate network. You use the same Microsoft account to log on to both computers. 

You have a folder with some personal documents on your desktop computer. The folder must be available and synced
between both computers. 

You need to ensure that the latest version of these files is available. What should you do? 

A. Create a folder by using OneDrive for Windows. Move all of the personal documents to the new folder. 

B. Move the folder to the Libraries folder. Go to PC Settings. Under Sync your settings, enable App settings. 

C. Right-click the folder and click Properties. Under Security, provide Full Control for the Microsoft account. 

D. Right-click the folder and select Share With, and then select Homegroup (view and edit). 

Correct Answer: A 

To save a doc you\\'re working on to OneDrive, select a OneDrive folder from the list of save locations. To move files to
OneDrive, open File Explorer and then drag them into a OneDrive folder. 

Note: OneDrive (previously SkyDrive, Windows Live SkyDrive, and Windows Live Folders) is a file hosting service that
allows users to sync files and later access them from a web browser or mobile device. Users can share files publicly or 

with their contacts; publicly shared files do not require a Microsoft account to access them. OneDrive is included in the
suite of online services formerly known as WindowsLive. 

References: 

https://www.windowscentral.com/how-create-one-large-volume-using-multiple-hard-drives-windows-10 

https://docs.microsoft.com/en-us/previous-versions/windows/it-pro/windows-
server-2008-R2-and-2008/cc725671(v=ws.11) 

 

QUESTION 2

You manage desktop computers on your company network. The finance department uses computers that run Windows
7 Enterprise and a 32-bit legacy application. The application has some compatibility issues with Windows 10
Enterprise. 

The application uses domain single sign-on for authentication. 

The vendor releases a new version of the application that is fully compatible with Windows 10 Enterprise. These
vendors cannot be installed on the same computer due to HKEY_CURRENT_USER registry setting conflicts. 

You need to migrate the finance department computers to Windows 10 Enterprise while meeting the following
requirements: 

Users are able to use the original version of the application while validating the new version. 

Once the new version is validated, the old version is removed with minimal effort. 

70-697 VCE Dumps | 70-697 Practice Test | 70-697 Braindumps                                2 / 9

https://www.passapply.com/70-697.html
https://www.passapply.com/70-697.html
https://www.passapply.com/70-697.html


https://www.passapply.com/70-697.html
2021 Latest passapply 70-697 PDF and VCE dumps Download

Users authenticate only once to use the application. 

Which technology should you choose? 

A. Microsoft Application Compatibility Toolkit (ACT) 

B. User Experience Virtualization (UE-V) 

C. User Experience Virtualization (UE-V) 

D. Hyper-V 

Correct Answer: A 

References: https://docs.microsoft.com/en-us/windows/deployment/planning/act-technical-reference 

 

QUESTION 3

You are a desktop administrator for a small company and have just upgraded two laptops from Windows 8 to Windows
10 Enterprise. 

When the computers were running Windows 8, Backup and Restore was active and was scheduled to back up data files
two times a day to an external hard disk. 

You need to enable File History so that copies of files are saved to a network drive. 

Which three actions should you perform in sequence? To answer, move the appropriate three actions from the list of
actions to the answer area and arrange them in the correct order. 

Select and Place: 

Correct Answer: 
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QUESTION 4

An organization has Microsoft System Center Configuration Manager (SCCM) version 1610. 

The organization purchases a Microsoft Intune subscription and must configure the mobile device management (MDM)
authority for that subscription to use SCCM. You need to deploy the required role in SCCM to support the Intune
service. 

Which role must you deploy in SCCM? 

A. enrollment proxy point 

B. service connection point 

C. enrollment point 

D. management point 

Correct Answer: B 

References: https://docs.microsoft.com/en-us/sccm/core/servers/deploy/configure/about-the-service-connection-point 

 

QUESTION 5

Note: This question is part of a series of questions that present the same scenario. Each question in the series contains
a unique solution that might meet the stated goals. Some question sets might have more than one correct solution,
while others might not have a correct solution. 

After you answer a question in this section, you will NOT be able to return to it. As a result, these questions will not
appear in the review screen. 

You administer devices in your corporate environment. The company allows employees to bring their own devices
(BYOD). All BYOD devices must run Windows 10. For employees who elect to not use BYOD, the company provides a 

corporate laptop. 

The company has a Microsoft Intune subscription and all BYOD devices have the Intune client installed. None of the
BYOD devices are joined to the domain. All the corporate standard devices are managed by System Center
Configuration 

Manager (SCCM). 

You have an application that was developed in house that must be installed on all the BYOD devices. 

The application must be installed automatically on the BYOD devices without any user intervention. 

Solution: You upload the app to the Intune storage and make the app available. 

Does the solution meet the goal? 

A. Yes 
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B. No 

Correct Answer: A 

References: https://docs.microsoft.com/en-us/intune/lob-apps-windows 

 

QUESTION 6

You administer Windows 10 Enterprise computers. Your company has a team of technical writers that is preparing
technical manuals and help files. The team manager wants to ensure that the technical writers are able to restore any 

documents that been modified within the last year. 

You need to ensure that the technical writers can restore Microsoft Word files to any previous versions for up to one
year. 

Which three actions should you perform in sequence? 

Select and Place: 

Correct Answer: 

 

 

QUESTION 7

Note: This question is part of a series of questions that present the same scenario. Each question in the series contains
a unique solution that might meet the stated goals. Some question sets might have more than one correct solution,
while 

others might not have a correct solution. 
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After you answer a question in this section, you will NOT be able to return to it. As a result, these questions will not
appear in the review screen. 

Your company uses Microsoft Office 365. 

You need to ensure that users are prompted to label and classify documents while they edit documents. 

Solution: You enable Microsoft Azure Information Protection. 

Does the solution meet the goal? 

A. Yes 

B. No 

Correct Answer: A 

References: https://docs.microsoft.com/en-us/information-protection/deploy-use/configure-policy 

 

QUESTION 8

A laptop runs Windows 10 Enterprise. You connect the laptop to a corporate network by using a VPN connection. 

The company policy requires all company computers to be restricted from the Internet access while connected to the
corporate network. 

You need to configure this laptop to ensure that it cannot access the Internet when its VPN connection to the corporate
network is active. 

What should you do? 

A. Configure the VPN connection to use only PPTP 

B. In the TCP/IPv4 properties of the VPN connection, enable the Use default gateway on remote network setting 

C. In the TCP/IPv4 properties of the VPN connection, disable the Use default gateway on remote network setting 

D. Configure the VPN connection to use only L2TP/IPSec 

Correct Answer: C 

References: https://www.nextofwindows.com/how-to-use-local-internet-connection-to-access-internet-while-still-
connected-with-vpn 

 

QUESTION 9

You have a Windows 10 Enterprise client Computer. 

The computer uses BitLocker Drive Encryption (BitLocker) on a fixed disk that only stores data. 

You need to prevent any data from being written to the fixed disk. 

What should you do? 
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A. Run the Add-BitLockerKeyProtector cmdlet. 

B. Run the manage-bde command and specify the -pause switch. 

C. Run the Lock-BitLocker cmdlet. 

D. Run the manage-bde command and specify the -off switch. 

Correct Answer: C 

 

 

QUESTION 10

Employees are permitted to bring personally owned portable Windows 10 Enterprise computers to the office. They are
permitted to install corporate applications by using the management infrastructure agent and access corporate email by 

using the Mail app. 

An employee\\'s personally owned portable computer is stolen. 

You need to protect the corporate applications and email messages on the computer. 

Which two actions should you perform? Each correct answer presents part of the solution. 

A. Prevent the computer from connecting to the corporate wireless network. 

B. Change the user\\'s password. 

C. Disconnect the computer from the management infrastructure. 

D. Initiate a remote wipe. 

Correct Answer: BD 

The personally owned portable Windows 10 Enterprise computers being managed by the management infrastructure
agent enables the use of remote wipe. By initiating a remote wipe, we can erase all company data including email from
the 

stolen device. 

Microsoft Intune provides selective wipe, full wipe, remote lock, and passcode reset capabilities. Because mobile
devices can store sensitive corporate data and provide access to many corporate resources, you can issue a remote
device 

wipe command from the Microsoft Intune administrator console to wipe a lost or stolen device. 

Changing the user\\'s password should be the first step. If the stolen computer is accessed before the remote wipe
happens, the malicious user could be able to access company resources if the laptop has saved passwords. 

References: 

https://technet.microsoft.com/en-gb/library/jj676679.aspx 
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QUESTION 11

You are the system administrator for a company. All devices run Windows 10 and use a variety of Microsoft Store for
Business apps. All user reports issues updating a Windows Store app. 

You need to troubleshoot the issue. 

Winch three actions should you perform? Each correct answer presents a complete solution. 

NOTE: Each correct selection is worth one point. 

A. Run the SFC command. 

B. Run the repair-bde command. 

C. Run the net start wuauserv command. 

D. Run the Windows App Troubleshooter. 

E. Use the Programs and Features Control Panel applet to repair the application. 

Correct Answer: ADE 

References: https://windowsreport.com/windows-10-app-store-doesn-t-update/#6 

 

QUESTION 12

A company has an Active Directory Domain Services (AD DS) domain. All client computers run Windows 10 Enterprise. 

You are configuring security for a portable client computer that does not have a Trusted Platform Module (TPM) chip
installed. 

You need to configure local Group Policy to turn on Windows BitLocker Drive Encryption on the computer. 

Which two actions should you perform? Each correct answer presents part of the solution. 

NOTE: Each correct selection is worth one point. 

A. Enable the Enforce drive encryption type on operating system drives policy setting. 

B. Enable the option to Alow BitLocker without a compatible TPM. 

C. Enable the Require additional authentication at startup policy setting. 

D. Configure the TPM validation profile to enable Platform Configuration Register indices (PCRs) 0, 2, 4, and 11. 

Correct Answer: BC 

References: https://www.howtogeek.com/howto/6229/how-to-use-bitlocker-on-drives-without-tpm/ 
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