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QUESTION 1

A group of users wants to see last year\\'s actuals as a reference when inputting their next year forecast. Which two are
recommended methods for creating this web form display? (Choose two.) 

A. Create two simple web forms ?one for last year\\'s actuals and one for next year\\'s forecast 

B. Create a composite web form ?one form displays last year\\'s actuals and one form displays next year\\'s forecast 

C. Create a navigation flow with multiple web forms displayed across vertical or horizontal tabs in a card 

D. Create one simple web form displaying the forecast and a report displaying the actuals 

E. Create a custom dashboard with a split canvas ?one area shows last year\\'s actuals and one area shown next
year\\'s forecast 

Correct Answer: CD 

 

 

QUESTION 2

Which two are valid commands in EPMAutomate? (Choose two.) 

A. epmautomate clearcube 

B. epmautomate copysnapshot.frominstance "Artifact Snapshot" serviceAdmin https://test- cloud-
pln.pbcs.us1.oraclecloud.com A12343 

C. epmautomate downloadfile dataexport.txt 

D. epmautomate runbusinessrule RollupUSSales Period=Q1 Entity=USA 

Correct Answer: CD 

downloadfile 

Downloads a file from an environment to the local computer. This command is used to download data, 

metadata, and back up snapshots for local storage. The file is downloaded into the folder from which you 

run the utility. 

Usage: epmautomate downloadfile "[FILE_PATH]/FILE_NAME" 

runbusinessrule 

Launches a business rule or ruleset. 

Usage: epmautomate runbusinessrule RULE_NAME [PARAMETER=VALUE], where: 

RULE_NAME is the name of a business rule exactly as it is defined in the environment. PARAMETER=VALUE indicates
optional runtime parameters and their values required to execute the business rule. 
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Example: epmautomate runbusinessrule RollupUSSales Period=Q1 Entity=USA 

 

QUESTION 3

Where would you navigate in Data Management to map source data to target scenarios? 

A. Category Mapping 

B. Target Application 

C. Import Format 

D. Data Flow Mapping 

Correct Answer: B 

Before you begin using FDMEE (Financial Data Quality Management Enterprise Edition), you must register 

the source system from which you want to import data. For Oracle Planning and Budgeting Cloud, it is a 

file-based source system. FDMEE creates a file- based source system automatically when you install and 

configure the product. You must also register the target application (for example, Planning) to which you 

want to load the data from one or more source systems. 

Steps to take source data from a data file that we downloaded from an Enterprise Resource Planning 

(ERP) source ledger and load the data to a Oracle Planning and Budgeting Cloud application. 

Etc. 

References: 

http://www.oracle.com/webfolder/technetwork/tutorials/obe/hyp/FDMEE11.1.2.3- PBCS/DataLoading.html 

 

QUESTION 4

What are two use cases for converting from Planning and Budgeting Cloud (PBCS) to Enterprise Planning and
Budgeting Cloud (EPBCS)? (Choose two.) 

A. The ability to directly integrate with Enterprise Performance Reporting Cloud (EPRCS). 

B. The ability to leverage out of the box frameworks, like Financials and Projects. 

C. The ability to utilize a fully integrated application, with shared metadata and direct data flows between plan types. 

D. The ability to use Data Management. 

E. The ability to directly integrate with on-premise Hyperion Planning. 

Correct Answer: AE 
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A: Enterprise Performance Reporting Cloud can be used through Integrated Sourcing from EPM and BI Applications
and Content. 

E: You can load Human Resources data from Oracle Human Capital Management Cloud to use in the Oracle Hyperion
Workforce Planning business process of Oracle Enterprise Planning and Budgeting Cloud. 

 

QUESTION 5

What is the correct sequence of steps for enabling each business process framework? 

A. Enable the framework, refresh the database 

B. Enable the framework, configure the framework, run post configuration tasks 

C. Configure the framework, refresh the database 

D. Run pre configuration tasks, enable the framework, configure the framework 

Correct Answer: D 

 

QUESTION 6

Which three are use cases for data maps? (Choose three.) 

A. To push data from a planning cube to a reporting cube 

B. To allow users to drill back to the data in a different cube 

C. To integrate data between custom plan types and the business frameworks 

D. To create a replicated partition between cubes 

E. To integrate data between the business frameworks 

Correct Answer: ABC 

Data maps are maps between a source application and a reporting application. You can map dimensions between a
source application database and a reporting database to enable: 

References: https://docs.oracle.com/cloud/latest/pbcs_common/PFUSA/understanding_data_maps.htm
#PFUSAf_data_maps_164 

 

QUESTION 7

Which business rule is unavailable to manipulate existing employee data? 

A. Remove Existing Employee 

B. Change Job 

C. Plan Departure 
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D. Transfer 

Correct Answer: A 

 

QUESTION 8

To staff resources onto initiatives, which custom dimension is required in the Map/Rename Dimensions section? 

A. Programs 

B. Initiatives 

C. Electives 

D. Projects 

Correct Answer: D 

If you are integrating Workforce or Capital with Projects, add a custom dimension called Project, the default dimension
name in Projects. If you name it anything else, make sure the dimension name is the same in all business processes. 

References: https://docs.oracle.com/cloud/latest/pbcs_common/EPBCA/common_enable_map_rename
_dimensions_104xf0d057d8-03.htm#EPBCA-GUID-7D681196-86D2-454E-AC4D- 727EFD533AB0 

 

QUESTION 9

Which two options are true when implementing security in Enterprise Planning and Budgeting Cloud (ePBCS)? (Choose
two.) 

A. Users are restricted from applications by removing application/module security 

B. ePBCS roles can be assigned to members in all dimensions 

C. The member that is set to read that has a parent with write access to all descendants will result in an access level of
read 

D. A user that is assigned read and write access to a member will result in write access 

Correct Answer: BD 

B: Assigning Access to Members To assign access to members: 

D: The application checks access permissions at each level, first by user, then by group, based on the member\\'s
access permissions inheritance relationship. If multiple access permissions exist, the least restrictive access permission
is applied (for example, Write access takes precedence over Read access). 

References: https://docs.oracle.com/cloud/latest/pbcs_common/PFUSA/assigning_access_to_members .htm
https://docs.oracle.com/cloud/latest/pbcs_common/PFUSA/about_effective_access_permis
sions_to_shared_members.htm#f_navigate_workspace_570 

 

QUESTION 10
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When importing data into the Financials framework, which Plan Element dimension member should be selected to help
keep track of the cube\\'s data sources? 

A. OFS_Integration 

B. OFS_Calculated 

C. OFS_Systems 

D. OFS_Load 

Correct Answer: D 

OFS_Load--Data value to import. 

References: https://docs.oracle.com/cloud/latest/pbcs_common/EPBCA/general_importing_financials_1
16x04dcf57d.htm#EPBCA-GUID-ABF5EAB0-A5D3-43CD-BA2E-72C56996AA2F 

 

QUESTION 11

Which variable does NOT need to be set before executing the OWP_Process Loaded Data business rule? 

A. andOEP_CurYr 

B. andOEP_CurMnth 

C. andOEP_YearRange 

D. andOEP_StartMnth 

Correct Answer: B 

 

QUESTION 12

An organization adds a dimension to their Enterprise Planning and Budgeting Cloud (EPBCS) Planning application.
Assuming that Data Management is being utilized, which step would need to be executed? 

A. Navigate to the Import Format screen in Data Management. Select the Import Format for the EPBCS application. Run
the "Refresh Members and Metadata" action to update dimensions. 

B. Navigate to the Target Application screen in Data Management, and select the EPBCS application. Run the "Refresh
Members and Metadata" action to update dimensions. 

C. Navigate to the Target Application screen in Data Management, and select the EPBCS application. Run the "Refresh
Metadata" action to update dimensions. 

D. Navigate to the Application Dimensions screen in Data Management. Refresh dimensions using the "Update
Application" action. 

Correct Answer: C 

References: https://docs.oracle.com/cd/E60665_01/epm- common/ERPIA/ erpi_reg_target_app.htm#ERPIA-
epmi_target_app_2 
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QUESTION 13

When setting up a data map, which two options are available for handling unmapped dimensions? (Choose two.) 

A. Selecting multiple unmapped dimension members of the source to map to a single unmapped dimension member on
the target 

B. Selecting a single unmapped dimension members of the source to map to a single unmapped dimension member on
the target 

C. Selecting a single unmapped dimension members of the source to map to multiple unmapped dimension member on
the target 

D. Selecting multiple unmapped dimension members of the source to map to multiple unmapped dimension member on
the target 

Correct Answer: AB 

Mapping Unmapped Dimensions 

To map unmapped dimensions in a data map: 

References: Oracle Cloud, Administering Planning for Oracle Enterprise Planning and Budgeting Cloud, 12-4 

 

QUESTION 14

Which two are NOT true with a Planning and Budgeting Cloud (PBCS) application? (Choose two.) 

A. Three custom planning applications can be Initialized 

B. Four custom reporting applications can be initialized 

C. Approvals is not included 

D. Groovy calculations are available 

Correct Answer: BC 

B: These are planning applications, not reporting applications. 

C: An approval unit is the basic unit for preparing, annotating, reviewing, and approving plan data. Approval units are
combinations of scenario, version, and entity or part of an entity. You can have one scenario/version combination per
approval unit. Scenarios and versions are the basis of the review cycle. Approval units submit planning data for a
scenario and version. 

 

QUESTION 15

What step is NOT required to calculate Merit dollars for each Employee within the Workforce framework? 

A. Enter or Load a Merit Override Rate. 
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B. Enter or Load a Merit Month by employee. 

C. Enter or Load a Performance Metric by employee. 

D. Ensure there is a Merit Rate for each Performance Metric and component definitions have been updated 

E. Execute the calculate Compensation Business Rule 

Correct Answer: A 
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