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QUESTION 1

You work for a semiconductor manufacturing company. You need to create a real-time application that automates the
quality control process. High-definition images of each semiconductor are taken at the end of the assembly line in real
time. The photos are uploaded to a Cloud Storage bucket along with tabular data that includes each semiconductor\\'s
batch number, serial number, dimensions, and weight. You need to configure model training and serving while
maximizing model accuracy. What should you do? 

A. Use Vertex AI Data Labeling Service to label the images, and tram an AutoML image classification model. Deploy the
model, and configure Pub/Sub to publish a message when an image is categorized into the failing class. 

B. Use Vertex AI Data Labeling Service to label the images, and train an AutoML image classification model. Schedule
a daily batch prediction job that publishes a Pub/Sub message when the job completes. 

C. Convert the images into an embedding representation. Import this data into BigQuery, and train a BigQuery ML K-
means clustering model with two clusters. Deploy the model and configure Pub/Sub to publish a message when a
semiconductor\\'s data is categorized into the failing cluster. 

D. Import the tabular data into BigQuery, use Vertex AI Data Labeling Service to label the data and train an AutoML
tabular classification model. Deploy the model, and configure Pub/Sub to publish a message when a semiconductor\\'s
data is categorized into the failing class. 

Correct Answer: A 

 

QUESTION 2

You have trained a model on a dataset that required computationally expensive preprocessing operations. You need to
execute the same preprocessing at prediction time. You deployed the model on AI Platform for high-throughput online
prediction. Which architecture should you use? 

A. Validate the accuracy of the model that you trained on preprocessed data. Create a new model that uses the raw
data and is available in real time. Deploy the new model onto AI Platform for online prediction. 

B. Send incoming prediction requests to a Pub/Sub topic. Transform the incoming data using a Dataflow job. Submit a
prediction request to AI Platform using the transformed data. Write the predictions to an outbound Pub/Sub queue. 

C. Stream incoming prediction request data into Cloud Spanner. Create a view to abstract your preprocessing logic.
Query the view every second for new records. Submit a prediction request to AI Platform using the transformed data.
Write the predictions to an outbound Pub/Sub queue. 

D. Send incoming prediction requests to a Pub/Sub topic. Set up a Cloud Function that is triggered when messages are
published to the Pub/Sub topic. Implement your preprocessing logic in the Cloud Function. Submit a prediction request
to AI Platform using the transformed data. Write the predictions to an outbound Pub/Sub queue. 

Correct Answer: B 

https://cloud.google.com/architecture/data-preprocessing-for-ml-with-tf-transform-pt1#where_to_do_preprocessing 

 

QUESTION 3

You are working on a binary classification ML algorithm that detects whether an image of a classified scanned
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document contains a company\\'s logo. In the dataset, 96% of examples don\\'t have the logo, so the dataset is very
skewed. Which metrics would give you the most confidence in your model? 

A. F-score where recall is weighed more than precision 

B. RMSE 

C. F1 score 

D. F-score where precision is weighed more than recall 

Correct Answer: A 

 

QUESTION 4

You need to analyze user activity data from your company\\'s mobile applications. Your team will use BigQuery for data
analysis, transformation, and experimentation with ML algorithms. You need to ensure real-time ingestion of the user
activity data into BigQuery. What should you do? 

A. Configure Pub/Sub to stream the data into BigQuery. 

B. Run an Apache Spark streaming job on Dataproc to ingest the data into BigQuery. 

C. Run a Dataflow streaming job to ingest the data into BigQuery. 

D. Configure Pub/Sub and a Dataflow streaming job to ingest the data into BigQuery, 

Correct Answer: A 

Previously Google pattern was Pub/Sub -> Dataflow -> BQ but now it looks as there is new Pub/Sub -> BQ
https://cloud.google.com/blog/products/data-analytics/pub-sub-launches-direct-path-to-bigquery-for-streaming-analytics 

 

QUESTION 5

You recently joined an enterprise-scale company that has thousands of datasets. You know that there are accurate
descriptions for each table in BigQuery, and you are searching for the proper BigQuery table to use for a model you are
building on AI Platform. How should you find the data that you need? 

A. Use Data Catalog to search the BigQuery datasets by using keywords in the table description. 

B. Tag each of your model and version resources on AI Platform with the name of the BigQuery table that was used for
training. 

C. Maintain a lookup table in BigQuery that maps the table descriptions to the table ID. Query the lookup table to find
the correct table ID for the data that you need. 

D. Execute a query in BigQuery to retrieve all the existing table names in your project using the
INFORMATION_SCHEMA metadata tables that are native to BigQuery. Use the result o find the table that you need. 

Correct Answer: A 

https://cloud.google.com/data-catalog/docs/concepts/overview 
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