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QUESTION 1

A Heroku application uses Heroku Connect to integrate with data from a Salesforce org. Since then, several fields from
the Salesforce objects that were mapped using Connect have been removed. As a result,the development team will
reload the mapping using Heroku Connect. 

What is an implication of reloading the mapping? 

A. The mapped tables in Heroku Postgres will continue to store the previously synchronized data, and synchronization
will restart normally. 

B. The mapped tables in Heroku Postgres will be truncated as part of the reload action. The data in removed fields will
be lost, and synchronization will pause until manually restarted. 

C. The mapped tables in Heroku Postgres will continue to store the previously synchronized data, but synchronization
will pause until manually restarted. 

D. The mapped tables in Heroku Postgres will be truncated as part of the reload action. The data in removed fields will
be lost, and synchronization will restart normally. 

Correct Answer: A 

 

 

QUESTION 2

A client requires that their web application\\'s logs are accessible only from within the same isolatednetwork as the
application itself. 

Which solution should an Architect recommend in this scenario? 

A. Deploy the application to a Private Space. Provide the Private Space\\'s stable outbound IPs to Heroku\\'s Logplex
router to block all logs originating fromthe Private Space. 

B. Deploy the application to a Shield Private Space with Private Space Logging enabled. Forward logs to a destination
within the Shield Private Space. 

C. Deploy the application to a Private Space. Connect the Private Space to an on-premise logging system using VPN
and specify it as a log drain. 

D. Deploy the application to a Private Space. Enable Internal Routing to prevent the application\\'s logs from being
forwarded outside of the Private Space. 

Correct Answer: C 

 

 

QUESTION 3

Which Is an effect of "locking" anapplication that belongs to a Heroku Enterprise Team? 
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A. New members of the Enterprise Team are granted no automatic permissions for the application. 

B. The application cannot be deployed until is unlocked. 

C. Members of the Enterprise Team who are not administrators have their permissions for the application revoked. 

D. Members of the Enterprise Team cannot be granted new permissions for the application until it\\'s unlocked. 

Correct Answer: A 

 

QUESTION 4

Aclient has a data Ina SAP data store. The client uses Heroku External Objects to expose Heroku Postgres tables in
their Salesforce org. They want to perform custom transformations on the SAP data and then expose the transformed
data in their Salesforce org. Which solution should an Architect recommend? 

A. Use Salesforce Connect to perform any necessary transformations on Vie SAP data and sync the transformed data
to the Salesforce org. 

B. Use Heroku Connect to sync the SAP data to Heroku Postgres and then perform any necessary transformations
Ensure the transformes data is in a table that is exposed in the Salesforce org. 

C. Use an ETL tool to sync the SAP data to Heroku and then perform any necessary transformations. Ensure the
transformes data is in a table that is exposed in the Salesforce org. 

D. Perform in-place transformations on the data in SAP and then use Heroku Connect to sync the SAP data to Heroku
Postgres. Ensure the transformed data is in a table that is exposed in the Salesforce org. 

Correct Answer: C 

https//www.heroKu.com/tech-sessions/get-started-wlth-apache-kafka 

 

QUESTION 5

Universal Containers (UC) has a front-end web application and a back-end service application running on Heroku. The
applications are running in the Common Runtime. Now, UC wants to prevent any public access to the back-end
application. 

Which two Heroku features should an Architect propose? 

A. Private Space VPN Connections 

B. Private Spaces DNS Service Discovery 

C. Heroku Internal Routing 

D. Apache Kafka on Heroku 

Correct Answer: AB 

https //devcenterheroku.com/articles/dataclips 
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