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QUESTION 1

States may impose nominal deductibles, coinsurance, or copayments on some Medicaid recipients for certain services.
Services for which states can require copayments from Medicaid recipients include: 

A. Emergency services 

B. Family planning services 

C. Both A and B 

D. A only 

E. B only 

F. Neither A nor B 

Correct Answer: D 

 

QUESTION 2

Arthur Dace, a plan member of the Bloom health plan, tried repeatedly over an extended period to schedule an
appointment with Dr. Pyle, his primary care physician (PCP). Mr. Dace informally surveyed other Bloom plan members
and found that many people were experiencing similar problems getting an appointment with this particular provider. Mr.
Dace threatened to take legal action against Bloom, alleging that the health plan had deliberately allowed a large
number of patients to select Dr. Pyle as their PCP, thus making it difficult for patients to make appointments with Dr.
Pyle. 

Bloom recommended, and Mr. Dace agreed to use, an alternative dispute resolution (ADR) method that is quicker and
less expensive than litigation. Under this ADR method, both Bloom and Mr. Dace presented their evidence to a panel of
medical and legal experts, who issued a decision that Bloom\\'s utilization management practices in this case did not
constitute a form of abuse. The panel\\'s decision is legally binding on both parties. 

Different types of compensation arrangements in managed care plans, from fee-for-service (FFS) arrangements to
capitation arrangements, lead to different types of fraud and abuse. From the answer choices below, select the
response that identifies the form of abuse in which Bloom is allegedly engaging, according to Mr. Dace\\'s complaint,
and whether this form of abuse is more likely to occur in FFS compensation arrangements or in capitation
arrangements. 

A. Type of abuse underutilization Type of compensation arrangement FFS arrangement 

B. Type of abuse underutilization Type of compensation arrangement capitation arrangement 

C. Type of abuse overutilization Type of compensation arrangement FFS arrangement 

D. Type of abuse overutilization Type of compensation arrangement capitation arrangement 

Correct Answer: B 

 

QUESTION 3
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From the following answer choices, choose the term that best corresponds to this description. 

Barrington Health Services, Inc. contracts with a state Medicaid agency as a fiscal intermediary. Barrington does not
provide medical services, but contracts with medical providers on behalf of the state Medicaid agency. 

A. Health insuring organization (HIO) 

B. Independent practice association (IPA) 

C. Physician practice management (PPM) company 

D. Peer review organization (PRO) 

Correct Answer: A 

 

QUESTION 4

Greenpath Health Services, Inc., an HMO, recently terminated some providers from its network in response to the
changing enrollment and geographic needs of the plan. A provision in Greenpath\\'s contracts with its healthcare
providers states that Greenpath can terminate the contract at any time, without providing any reason for the termination,
by giving the other party a specified period of notice. 

The state in which Greenpath operates has an HMO statute that is patterned on the NAIC HMO Model Act, which
requires Greenpath to notify enrollees of any material change in its providernetwork. As required by the HMO Model Act,
the state insurance department is conducting an examination of Greenpath\\'s operations. The scope of the on-site
examination covers all aspects of Greenpath\\'s market conduct operations, including its compliance with regulatory
requirements. 

From the following answer choices, select the response that identifies the type of market conduct examination that is
being performed on Greenpath and the frequency with which the HMO Model Act requires state insurance departments
to conduct an examination of an HMO\\'s operations. 

A. Type of examination: comprehensive; Required frequency: annually 

B. Type of examination: comprehensive; Required frequency: at least every three years 

C. Type of examination: target; Required frequency: annually 

D. Type of examination: target; Required frequency: at least every three years 

Correct Answer: B 

 

QUESTION 5

One example of health plan\\'s influence on the practice of medicine is that, during the past decade, the focus of
healthcare has moved toward _________________, which is designed to reduce the overall need for healthcare
services by providing patients with decision-making information. 

A. Demand management 

B. Managed competition 

C. Comprehensive coverage 
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D. Private inurement 

Correct Answer: A 
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